
Chance Cards

DROUGHT 

A large drought strikes your 
community. Lose one drinking 
water card per population card. 

FLOOD 

A large flood strikes your 
community. Lose one food 
card. 

TORNADO 

A large tornado strikes your 
community. Lose one energy 
card. 

RAINS 

Your community experiences 
large rainfall. Pick up one 
drinking water card. 

BUMPER CROP 

Your community experiences a 
bumper crop. Pick up one food 
card. 

MINERAL LODE 

Your community finds new 
mineral reserves. Pick up one 
energy card. 

MIGRATION 

Members from a nearby 
community are displaced. 
Trade in all of your products for 
population cards. 

GOLD RUSH 

Your community strikes a gold 
vein. Pick up 5 tokens.  

EPIDEMIC 

Your community is stricken by 
an epidemic. Lose one 
population card. 



  

TECHNICAL ERRORS 

A technician makes an error 
and short circuits one of your 
facilities. Pay 1 token to get it 
back online. 
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